
   

 
 
 
 
 
 

HOCKEY HALL OF FAME ANNOUNCES EXECUTIVE SEARCH  
FOR THE NEXT PRESIDENT AND CEO  

 
TORONTO (November 1, 2024) – Lanny McDonald, Chair of the Board of the Hockey Hall 
of Fame (HHOF), announced today that the search is underway for the successor of the 
longtime President and CEO, Jeff Denomme, who will retire from his position at the end of 
June 2025 after 39 years with the organization (see prior release).  
 
“We are pleased to announce Preston Human Capital Group will conduct this high-profile 
search following an extensive competitive process to select the executive recruitment firm 
to conduct this effort,” said McDonald.  “Preston Human Capital Group has demonstrated 
a keen insight into the requirements of the Hockey Hall of Fame, a passionate and personal 
approach to the needs of the search, and the experience and expertise to lead this process.”  
 
“We are proud to partner with the Hockey Hall of Fame, an iconic institution representing 
the best of hockey and its legacy here in Canada and around the world,” said Cathy 
Preston, President and CEO of Preston Human Capital Group, who is leading the search.   
“It’s an honour to be working alongside the Search Committee for the next President and 
CEO who will lead the Hall into its next exciting phase of growth”.  
 
The Position Profile can be found here: www.phcap.ca/hhof.   Interested candidates are 
asked to please follow the application instructions outlined on the profile.  The search closes 
on December 31, 2024, at 5pm EST.  
_________________________ 
 
The Hockey Hall of Fame (“HHOF”) was established in 1943 to honour and memorialize 
individuals who have brought special distinction to the game of hockey and those who 
made outstanding contributions to the development and advancement of hockey anywhere 
in the world, and to collect, research, preserve, exhibit and promote objects, images and 
other historical materials connected with the game at all levels. As a not-for-profit 
corporation and registered charity, HHOF owns and operates a museum and place of 
entertainment offering state-of-the-art exhibits, theatrical presentations and educational 
programming from its premises at Brookfield Place, Toronto, and a multi-purpose archive, 
resource centre and research facility located at 400 Kipling Avenue, Toronto. 
 
Preston Human Capital Group (“PHC”) is a high performance, owner-operated executive 
search firm whose capital is driving business results through hiring exceptional human 
capital. With their ‘think like an owner’ mindset, PHC combine their proven inclusive 
process with business intelligence, passion and deep curiosity to understand their client’s 
business.  Established in 2006, PHC has been providing executive search solutions within 
the nonprofit and charitable sectors ever since. Connecting great humans is their capital.  
 
CONTACT:  Preston Human Capital Group - Cathy Preston cathy@phcap.ca   

Hockey Hall of Fame - Kelly Masse kmasse@hhof.com  
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